
AGENDA ITEM FOR ADMINISTRATIVE MEETING

FROM (DEPT/ DIVISION): Stephen Craisen. Elections/Records

PROGRAM: Elections

SUBJECT: ElectionsPayable

ATTACHMENTS: Payable

Date: (10-22-2025) Submitted By: (Stephen Craigen)
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Checkoffs:

) Dept. Head (copy)

) Fiscal

) Legal (copy)

) (Other - List )

To be notified of Meeting: Dan Lonai

Needed at Meeting

Scheduled for meeting on: November 5,2025

Action taken:

Follow-up:

( ) Discussion only
(X) Action
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Attached is a payable for 110,000 #10 return ballot
packet envelopes for the upcoming elections. The
invoice is $8,195.00, which is over $5,000 and
requires Commissioner approval. This is a routine
expense for conducting an election, and has been
budgeted. This order for envelopes is enough for two
county-wide elections.

) ACTION REOUESTED:

Approve payable to Cenveo V/orldwide Limited
in the amount of $8,195
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FINANCE COÐES¡NVO¡CE DATE

08/19!2A25

INVOICE TOTAL

$8,195.00

INVOICE NUMBER

111-708159

ÐESCRIPTION

11 0,000 #1 0 envelopes -return sig

ACCOUNT#

35300-52001 3

AMOUNT

$8,195.00
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1Ut2 UZC, 4:Uþ rM Umatillâ County Mail - Re: Paytnent lnquiry

ÆW Kim Lindell <kim.lindell@umatillacounty.gov>

Re: Payment lnquiry
3 messages

Dan Lonai <dan.lonai@um.atillacounty.gov> Tue, Oct 21,2025 at 3:37 pM
Reply-ïo; dan. lona i@ u matill acou n ty.gov
To: "Hamilton, Curtis" <C.urtis.Hamilton@cenveo.com>, Kim Lindell <kim.lindell@umatillacounty,gov>, Stephen Craigen
<stephen.cra igen@umatillacounty.gov>

Curtis,

I am including Kim and Steve in this email. The only invoice I was aware of was g174gg which we just paid. I have not seen
this invoice, 914485, before, lwill have Kim check on it and will get back to you.

Thank you,

Þan

on Mon, oct 20, 2a25 at B:294M Hamilton, curtis <curtis.Hamilton@cenveo.com> wrote:

Hi Dan,

Would you be able to assist in providing payment information for
the item below? I am attaching a copy of the invoice for your
reference. Thank you,

7081 59 9t19t2025 9t18t2025 $8,195.00

Thank Vou,

Curtis Hamilton

Accounts Receivable

912.590.7916

, Curtis. Hamilton@Cenveo.com
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